
FLAF SPORTS 
SERVICES, INC

U.S. TENNIS & 
RECREATION 

CLOSE 
CONSTRUCTION, LLC 

SOUTHERN STRIPING 
LLC 

SPORT SURFACES 
LLC 

COMPASS 
CONSTRUCTION, INC. 

TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST

1 Demolition LS $17,250.00 $19,800.00 $12,000.00 $9,004.50 $6,000.00 $13,140.00

2 Repave courts LS $53,850.00 $19,300.00 $20,000.00 $14,616.00 $58,300.00 $39,420.00

3 New Fencing LS $0.00 $28,300.00 $18,000.00 $29,846.34 $22,800.00 $21,318.00

4 Court surfacing LS $16,340.00 $14,700.00 $15,000.00 $20,653.16 $13,000.00 $23,298.00

5 Windscreens & Nets LS $1,630.00 $1,850.00 $10,000.00 $4,735.12 $4,900.00 $1,400.00

6 Permits LS $0.00 $280.00 $500.00 $1,132.15 by City $1,000.00

7 General conditions/Other items LS $0.00 $8,270.00 $20,000.00 $17,455.49 $0.00 $16,795.00

$89,070.00 $92,500.00 $95,500.00 $97,442.76 $105,000.00 $116,371.00

ITEM ALTERNATE BID - REPAIR COURTS (TWO)  FLAF SPORTS 
SERVICES, INC

U.S. TENNIS & 
RECREATION 

CLOSE 
CONSTRUCTION, LLC 

SOUTHERN STRIPING 
LLC 

SPORT SURFACES 
LLLC 

COMPASS 
CONSTRUCTION, INC. 

1 Limited Demolition - mill Courts  LS $11,800.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 no bid $8,000.00 $8,760.00

2 Limited rebuild courts - patching LS $17,735.00 $15,575.00 $15,000.00 no bid $25,900.00 $25,733.00

3 New Fencing LS *$0.00 $28,300.00 $18,000.00 no bid $22,800.00 $21,318.00

4 Court surfacing LS $16,340.00 $14,700.00 $15,000.00 no bid $13,000.00 $23,298.00

5 New Fencing LS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 no bid $0.00 $0.00

6 Windscreens & Nets LS $1,630.00 $1,850.00 $10,000.00 no bid $4,900.00 $1,400.00

7 Permits LS $0.00 $280.00 $500.00 no bid by City $1,000.00

8 General conditions/Other items LS $0.00 $4,500.00 $20,000.00 no bid $0.00 $11,267.00

$47,505.00 $68,205.00 $90,500.00 no bid $74,600.00 $92,776.00

City of Naples
Opening Date 04/26/18 - FOR INFORMATION PURPOSE ONLY

18-055 SEAGATE PARK TENNIS COURTS UPGRADE ITB 

Note 1 : Flaf Sports Services Inc. bid submittal was found non-responsive. Vendor did not submit lump sum 
cost for line item 3 new fencing of the alternate bid schedule.
Note 2 : Bonness Inc., submitted a Statement of No Bid. 

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID 

TOTAL AMOUNT BID ALTERNATE 

ITEM  BASE BID - REBUILD COURTS (TWO) UNIT 
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